
QUESTIONS:
1.  When will the economic crisis end?
2. Do you think we’ve learned our lesson by now? Or will we eventually end up in another crisis?
3. Can you sketch a general economic vision; give us a look into the future?
4. What’s your opinion on complementary currencies?
5. Do you think the capitalistic system is outdated?

FOR THE LOVE OF 
MONEY

It has been scientifically proved: 
money makes you an asshole. More 
specifically: thinking about money 
makes you an asshole. Not in so many 
words of course, but the results of a 
psychological experiment conducted 
by Dr. Kathleen D. Vohs of the Uni-
versity of Minnesota school of mana-
gement boiled down to pretty much 
that conclusion. Subjects who were 
‘primed’ to think about money turned 
out to be less likely to seek assis-
tance from or provide help to others 
when solving puzzles, less willing 
to volunteer their time and reluctant 
to donate to a worthy cause. In other 
words: they behaved like certified 
pricks. So then what the hell is ‘pri-
ming’ you ask? Here goes:

“Priming in psychology occurs when 
an earlier stimulus influences res-
ponse to a later stimulus. One theory 
of priming is that the first stimulus 
activates parts of particular repre-
sentation or associations in memory 
just before carrying out an action or 
task. The representation is already 
activated when the second stimulus is 
encountered, thus improving perfor-
mance of the task. It is considered to 
be one of the manifestations of impli-
cit memory.”

We’re not making this up. Think about 
what that means for a society where 
basically every person is ‘primed’ 
to think about money all the time. I 
mean, when are we not thinking about 
money? The only people who don’t 
have to think about their cash are the 
ones who have plenty of it, the rest 
of us are constantly aware of exactly 
how much money we have, owe or are 
owed. What we can and can’t buy if 
we want to make the end of the mon-
th. Everyday there’s a new bill waiting 
to be opened and left to linger long 
enough for the next one to arrive the 
day after it finally does get paid. How 
can you not be thinking about money? 
Everything you do costs money, the-
refore it’s the only thing that most 
people are ever primed to think about 
except maybe sex if you don’t get to 
have any of that either, and that’s a 
primal urge, a life-ensuring fail-safe 
on our survival as a species. Sure, 
some people are fortunate enough to 
not have to think about their money in 
the least bit, but balancing the bud-
get is a primary point of concern to 
most regular folks.

PRAYING TO PENNIES & 
DIMES
Another experiment by the same Dr. 
Vohs revealed that money can also be 
a drug that can reduce physical pain 
and make people feel stronger and 
more secure about themselves social-
ly. These results were obtained after 
making one group of subjects count 
large-denomination bills (that’s eve-
rything bigger than 20€ in human 
words), while a control group merely 
counted blank paper bills. The people 
who handled the money had more re-
sistance to physical pain stimuli and 
reported greater feelings of inner 
strength and sulf-sufficiency during 
social testing. ‘Oh’, you say, ‘so mo-
ney does have some positive effects 
on people after all?’ Ok, then when 
was the last time you sat around 
counting your money and it lasted 
more than fifteen seconds? Exactly. 
Most people just don’t have multiple 
stacks of money of various unknown 
sizes lying around the house. The 
majority of my money is usually in 
the bank, which means I don’t really 
get to count it that much, or even see 
it for that matter (unless it’s a really 
bad month and the majority of my mo-
ney is in my pocket, and in that case 
there’s not a lot of counting to it).

Combination of these findings? The 
human populace is being conditioned 
into being antisocial jerks by being 
constantly reminded of their financial 
predicament by means of bills, rent, 
down payments, taxes, salaries, the 
list is endless. You want to know so-
mething really sad? Scientist Roy 
Baumeister of Florida State Univer-
sity had the following to say about 
the correlation between money and a 
person’s mood: "It might be handy to 
sit down and count a stack of money 
before going out to a job interview." 
Sure, why not start praying to the 

Did you ever check out the ten secu-
rity features of the almighty euro bill 
when you’re at a bar calling for ano-
ther double shot of Saint James? Nei-
ther did we. However, the odds that 
you unknowingly spend or cash in 
some fake banknotes are increasing 
day by day. Designing, printing and 
selling counterfeit money has be-
come a large and well-organized yet 
permanently obscure business. The 
illegal money machine is printing out 
hundreds of banknotes per minute; 
powered by a devious legion of gra-
phic designers, offset printers and 
metallurgists operating in a murky 
background. 

The concept of creating currency wi-
thout the state’s legal sanction has 
existed for as long as legal money 
itself, obviously because it seems 
like the leisurely way to becoming 
filthy rich. And for as long as our mo-
ney-grubbing society runs on cash, 
these most creative agents of fraud 
remain determined to stay up to date 
with every possible technique used. 
In the last year, international police 
agencies Interpol and Europol dis-
mantled about a dozen highly pro-
fessional money-printing factories. 
Anti-counterfeiting cells across the 
EU intercepted approximately 60,000 
false banknotes each month, mostly 
twenty and fifty euro bills. We’ve wit-
nessed with our own eyes that 75% of 
these bills are hardly distinguishable 
from official banknotes. Even min-
ting coins is hip once again in coun-
terfeiting circles; last year, the pile of 
fake change seized by the Belgian fe-
deral police increased by approxima-
tely 15,000 counterfeit coins, mostly 
€2. By contrast: in the years before 

around 20,000 false banknotes, most 
of them spotlessly imitated to the 
smallest detail. ‘Real from start to fi-
nish’, Peeters says, his hand holding 
a nearly perfect-looking 200 euro bill. 
‘The images on these banknotes are 
completely redrawn, which is one of 
the most important aspects of coun-
terfeiting paper money since it really 
improves the printing quality. It’s 
obviously the work of a professional 
graphic designer. But look at the ink 
used, perfectly emulated, except for 
the color-changing number since this 
is printed with special ink that is real-
ly hard to obtain. The hologram was 
imitated, the watermark is close to 
perfect and even the UV-falsification 
on most of these bills nearly indistin-
guishable.’ So far for the reliability of 
your UV-controller.

“It must feel great 
to grinningly smack 
the government’s 
already battered 
face with a phony 
bankroll.”
The ever-increasing cunning of money 
counterfeiting has a dark history that 
takes you way back to the beginnings 
of modern civilization. The oldest 
counterfeit coins that archeologists 
have found, date back to around 600 
BC, approximately the same period 
when the first officially stamped coins 
were minted in Asia Minor and Turkey. 
The first money was barely being 

spread throughout the Greek and Per-
sian world in cities like Lydia or Efeze, 
and the ultimate scam in the form of 
golden or silver coins with a copper 
core was already there to follow in 
its path. Ever since then, local ban-
dits, Roman armies and even official 
minting ateliers have been spilling 
blood, sweat and tears to pour coins 
– even with official stamps - or print 
bills that could be passed off as ge-
nuine currency. In Saint-Mard, close 
to the Belgian village of Virton, ar-
cheologists dug up an ancient works-
hop with hundreds of clay forms with 
coin molds from the Roman Empire. In 
the French village of Châteaubleau on 
the eastside of Paris – a hamlet with a 
current population of ca. 300 people 
– no less than five or six similar ate-
liers were found. But it was the Nazis 
who pulled the biggest counterfeit 
scam in history. Making a war tool out 
of everything, Nazi Germany forced a 
team of Jewish captives – led by mas-
ter counterfeiter Salomon Sorowitsch 
– to work on Operation Bernhard; 
this selected team of Jewish artists 
and craftsmen designed and printed 
millions of dollars and pounds while 
living a life of privilege in the Sach-
senhausen concentration camp, with 
the aim of destabilizing the US and 
Great-Britain’s economy. Although 
the quality of the forged money was 
extraordinary, the Nazis were never 
able to get the bills into circulation 
in time. So who knows, we just might 
have had Adolf Hitler’s uptight mug 
on today’s Mark bills if the sting had 
gone through. 

Surprisingly enough, our own country 
has no significant players in the mo-
ney counterfeiting business, as po-
lice officers mostly have to focus on 
amateurs and distribution networks. 
We tailed a Belgian printer who was 
convicted for offset printing 5,000 
ten-dollar bills - but when we even-
tually met him and asked him about it, 
he clammed up, especially about the 
part where his accomplice was caught 
red-handed in Paris while attempting 
to spend some of the banknotes on a 
French prostitute. ‘As far as we know, 
professional counterfeiters aren’t 
operating on our territory’, chief com-
missioner Peeters continues. ‘By the 
end of 2006, we were able to disco-
ver and arrest fifteen people from a 
bigger network in Mons. But if you 
want to know about the most impor-
tant money counterfeiting case in this 
country’s history, I honestly can’t tell 
you a single thing. It’s a matter of dis-
tribution and the investigation is in 
progress as we speak.’ Money coun-
terfeiters sometimes create an entire 
banknote in one sophisticated and 
highly secretive workshop. In other 
cases every aspect of the produc-
tion takes place in another facility: 

the printing, the making of the holo-
grams, watermarks. They basically 
operate in a structure that is similar to 
the one you find in drug cartels. The 
giant producers ‘sell their money’ to a 
couple of outlets who resell it to their 
distributors. The money ends up with 
several dealers who resell it in smal-
ler amounts to the customers. Mostly, 
these customers recruit someone to 
spend the money. ‘Here, take this 100 
euro bill, buy whatever you want for 
15 euro and give me back the change.’

But far away from the shopping malls, 
investigators have delineated three 
main productive areas. Italian crimi-
nals wouldn’t be Italian criminals if 
they weren’t knowingly ahead of the 
game. They take the absolute lead in 
printing notes and minting coins as 
well as distribution. A lot of their acti-
vities are situated around Naples, so 
the involvement of the Camorra mafia 
clan is widely accepted. However, du-
ring the last couple of years, the Bal-
kan is printing banknotes like there’s 
no tomorrow. Recently police confis-
cated large amounts of fake notes in 
printing offices in Serbia and Bulga-
ria. Another important proliferator is 
Columbia where especially the drug 
cartels are highly active. A lot of dol-
lars have been printed in Columbia, 
but ever since the dollar decreased, 
Columbians have started to imitate 
euro bills en masse as well. However, 
they don’t use the money to spend 
in the regular economy: it’s used to 
trick other parties during drug tran-
sactions.

The question is whether we should 
give a damn about a couple of false 
bucks more or less in our pocket? As 
long as officers can’t prove that you 
had the intention to spend a counter-
feit banknote, you can’t get punished. 
And who or what is going to be the 
judge of that? As a matter of fact, 
we’ve seriously considered printing 
our own counterfeit money, seeing 
as how basically even a moron with 
a computer and an inkjet printer can 
create his own pocket cash.* Besides, 
the only good money counterfeiter is 
the one who can create a banknote 
he can actually spend, and it must 
feel great to grinningly smack the 
government’s already battered face 
with a phony bankroll. Think again: 
the latter is exactly the main reason 
why money counterfeiters are so hea-
vily punished. In the Middle Ages, 
counterfeiters were even executed in 
public by being cooked alive in giant 
casseroles. These days the laws are a 
tad milder, but still the punishments 
for money counterfeiters are very 
severe. If you get caught, you’ll fa-
cing up to fifteen or twenty years. So 
think, before you print.
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of the problem was, as it always is, 
a lack of money. With millions being 
withdrawn by frightened civilians 
every hour, the infection of bank runs 
threatened to spread out to other 
banks. Old-school tycoon and in-
dustrialist J.P. Morgan pretty much 
single-handedly bailed out the banks 
and trust funds by breaking open his 
own piggy bank and getting some of 
his equally ridiculously rich friends to 
do the same. Not only would this inde-
bt the banks to him, in the process he 
also conveniently got to take over one 
of his biggest competitors, the Ten-
nessee Coal, Iron and Railroad Com-
pany (because the company’s immi-
nent collapse would further the crisis) 
in spite of President Roosevelt’s anti-
trust laws. How did he by-pass these 
laws? By presenting Teddy Roose-
velt with a piece of paper to sign and 
about an hour to think about whether 
he was going to sign it or risk to plun-
ging the rest of the country into the 
Grand Panic as well. Needless to say, 
the takeover was approved and the 
banks got bailed out. US Steel would 
become one of the biggest steel ma-
nufacturers in the world and thanks 
to his altruistic efforts, J.P. Morgan 
became even richer than he already 
was and a laurelled hero of financials 
at the same time. 

“Making a profit 
and free energy for 
the people are two 
things that don’t 
mix.”
Don’t get us wrong, Morgan was a 
brilliant man who saved an entire 
economy practically by himself and 
deserves praise for it. But he also saw 
the opportunities that came with the 
crisis, and he probably wouldn’t have 
stepped in there had been no spoils to 
reap. In case you’re wondering, that’s 
the same J.P. Morgan who financed 
Nikola Tesla’s research into wireless 
electricity transmission (the Warden-
clyffe tower - do yourself a favor and 
look it up if you haven’t heard about 
it) and then pulled the plug when Tes-
la couldn’t show him where he could 
‘put the meter’. Making a profit and 
free energy for the people are two 
things that don’t mix, after all. But 
still, in some weird way, greed brings 
out the best in some people (even if 
those people are actually evil), and 
if those people’s interests happen 
to coincide with those of the general 
public, then some good can definitely 
come of it. That just really rarely is the 
case, since the wealth of one man sa-
dly enough implies another man’s po-
verty most of the time. (We don’t say 
‘man’ because we’re sexists and feel 
that women shouldn’t be in charge, 
but because men still make up the 
majority of corporate pirates and as-
sorted assholes, so if anything, take 
it as a compliment.)

A $20.000.000 BONUS FOR 
BANKRUPTCY
So anyway, that’s what happened a 
century ago. A few guys who already 
had more money than you’ll ever 
spend in your entire life tried to make 
a lot more money fast, which royally 
fucked up the world and pretty much 
laid down the groundwork for the 
next crisis that would then practically 
cause WWII; and also made a lot of 
other already wealthy men even weal-
thier in the meanwhile. Now we’re 
not saying that that is exactly what’s 
happening right now, but we’re pretty 
bloody positive that there are some 
striking similarities. Why? Because 
that’s just the way we humans do 
things. Making a profit makes up 90% 
of the Western cultural heritage. It’s 
almost like our prime directive. Ma-
king a buck is the most natural thing 
to do, and we have made a plane-
tary sport out of it. The fact remains 
that someone has to be responsible 
for the situation we find ourselves 
in right now. It has become rather 
clear that the US housing bubble is 
the main cause for today’s crisis, and 
the people who could have done so-
mething to prevent it from popping 
open failed to do so at the right time. 

We’re talking about people like Ri-
chard F. Syron, the former CEO of 
Freddie Mac, who ignored the war-
nings that were presented to him 
by the company’s risk officer David 
Andrukonis, who feared that Fred-
die Mac was jeopardizing its own fi-
nancial health and that of the entire 
country by financing risk-laden loans. 
Syron ignored this advice and kept 
the company on course, telling finan-
cial analysts in 2007 that he expected 
Freddie Mac to take a couple of hard 
hits on the weakening housing mar-
ket. Nevertheless, this guy left the 

company with more than $19 million 
in cash, stocks and other executive 
compensation. So wait, first this guy 
ignores the advice given to him by 
the one person who is responsible 
for assessing the company’s finan-
cial health, thereby almost single-
handedly runs his company and by 
extension the national economy into 
the ground, and then as a reward he 
makes off with almost twenty million 
in severance pay? Don’t most people 
just get fired for doing a shitty job, 
instead of getting 20 million dollars? 
And on top of that, what kind of ass-
hole would even do a thing like that? 
Who ruins a company, almost perso-
nally lays down the entire ground-
work for an economic crisis, and then 
just says ‘fuck it, I deserve a little bo-
nus for doing a shitty job’? 

“Don’t most people 
just get fired for 
doing a shitty job, 
instead of getting 
20 million dollars?”
Of course, Syron wasn’t the only 
person responsible for the housing 
bubble going pop, and he certainly 
wasn’t the only corporate asshole 
who felt he could give himself a mul-
ti-million dollar bonus for being fired 
from a top position. Basically, this 
whole thing went down because thou-
sands of people were spending mo-
ney they didn’t have and had to lend 
from banks, who in their turn took out 
loans from investors in exchange for 
mortgage-backed securities as re-
turns on their investments. People 
were investing into real estate out of 
some misplaced sense of optimism: 
they were being told that the value 
of the homes they were investing in 
would only increase over time, when 
there was really no reason for that 
to happen. Lending money to home-
buyers had become so profitable 
and deregulated that prospective 
owners hardly even had to put down 
any cash in order to get a mortgage: 
their homes would be entirely built 
out of borrowed money, money they 
would only then start to pay back!  
So, how does this work in everyday 
life? You get a loan for a house from 
a bank that in turn gets the money 
from private investors from all over 
the world. These investors are encou-
raged to invest their money in real es-
tate because of the supposed value 
increase, which in reality isn’t really 
there. 

Why? Because there are profits to be 
made, and if the owners fail to come 
up with their mortgage payments, 
then all you need to do -as a lender- is 
snatch up the house keys and repos-
sess the house at a lower value than 
the one it was originally sold at. What 
does that mean? That means that a 
lot of home owners are going to end 
up re-selling their own houses at de-
creased value, and living in the tent 
cities that are now popping up all over 
the richest countries in the world, for 
example the US of A. This is what hap-
pens when everybody is kept just rich 
enough and still motivated to spend 
way above his or her income, and 
has enough money to lose and debts 
to pay to not start a revolution. Until 
you push people too far, which is so-
mething that might be happening in 
front of our very noses right now, only 
time will tell. 

CRIME PAYS

Excuse us, but we’re inclined to say 
that what happened here is a crime. 
It’s the same thing as 100 years ago. 
Financial crisis is really just the cor-
porate word for stick-up. We got jac-
ked. Robbed. This is like waking up in 
a house that has been burgled over-
night, only there’s no use in calling 
the police. The criminals who robbed 
you might as well have been living 
on the Moon, because they’re never 
going to stand in front of a judge or 
go to jail. No, instead of that they ban-
krupt entire economies and then get 
to go home with a severance pay that 
can buy a small country. You can’t sue 
them and you don’t get to talk to them 
to get as much as an explanation for 
why your life’s savings are worthless 
all of a sudden. These types rule our 
entire world with financial force and 
legislative control, and they have an 
army full of people that you can’t put 
the blame on. The bank teller who has 
to tell you that your money is gone 
didn’t take your pension; she’s just 
glad she has a job for the time being.  
The security guy who tells you to stop 
yelling desperately at her before he 
has to escort you off the premises 
by force would probably do the same 
thing if he were in your shoes. 

About 99% of the world had to be 
a victim so that a few very wealthy 
people could become even richer. 
And unlike F. Augustus Heinze (who 
got exonerated after a lucky trial but 
still lived a miserable life afterwards, 
ha!), they’re getting away with it. 
They’ll never be brought to justice 
for what they did, because there was 
never anything illegal about it. Those 
in power get to design the world we 
live in and the laws we obey, and the 
laws that allowed this to happen, 
have been written quite a while ago. 
The only way to make sure that this 
sort of thing never happens again is 
by getting rid of greed itself; and on 
the day that that finally happens, eve-
ry stock-jockey who ever splattered 
to death on Wall Street’s well-swept 
pavement will be freezing his ass off 
in Hell. Of course that’s never going 
to happen, the days of Communism 
are gone forever unless China takes 
over the world (yeah, laugh now) and 
even then who knows? The one thing 
we ask is please, tell it like it is. Don’t 
blame the housing bubble or the 
stock market or derivatives or wha-
tever else is new in grand theft eco-
nomics, blame the crooked greedy 
bastards who come up with those 
concepts and then run them like shit. 

100 YEARS OF PANIC:
1907-2009CASH RULES EVERYTHING 

AROUND ME

Money can do some strange things 
to the way we see the world. For 
example, money is the sole fac-
tor that separates public space and 
private space. It’s the difference 
between advertisement and vanda-
lism. In a lot of cases, money draws 
the thin line between right and wrong 
(making this magazine would become 
a lot harder if we didn’t have an adver-
tisement on the other side to justify 
our existence). 

Money has become more than the 
three functions that you can find in 
most economic manuals. More than a 
store of value, a medium of exchange 
and a unit of account. Nowadays, the 
concept of legal tender has grown 
into a way of life, a primary motive 
that propels the supposed evolu-
tion of our society and justifies the 
exhibition of otherwise completely 
unacceptable behaviour. I’m no eco-
nomist, but I can safely say that mo-
ney makes the world go round and 
round in dizzying elliptic circles that 
can make you want to get off and 
puke your guts out. Our previous is-
sues dealt with concepts that either 
obeyed or disobeyed the rules. Mo-
ney is the only thing that can bend the 
rules without breaking them. If you 
look closely, you’ll see that it is in fact 
one of the main underlying motives in 
all of our previous issues. Everything 
big enough to mention usually has so-
mething to do with money. 

Cash rules. There’s no way around it. 
What we wanted to do with this issue 
is find out exactly how it does so, and 
who gets to be its main representa-
tive in the human realm. Because ho-
nestly, we are in no way experts on 
this particular topic, partly because 
it’s so damn faceless yet omnipresent 
and interwoven with all aspects of our 
ever more complex society. We just 
felt that we had to know something. 
So we went out looking for sense in 
the vaults of history, blowing the dust 
from time-worn documents dated 
yesteryear in search of any potential 
parallels to our current crisis. We pon-
dered the concept of counterfeit mo-
ney and how it influences the ‘real’ 
economy. We even got capitalism’s 
white knight Jim Rogers to shed a per-
sonal light on the problems at hand 
(take that, everybody who said that 
POSTRmagazine was just another 
snooty leftie-liberal coffeehouse-re-
volutionary pamphlet with no regard 
for any intelligent right-wing input), 
along with author-economist and pro-
fessor Bernard Lietaer who you might 
remember from ‘The Future Of Money’ 
if you’re into that sort of literature. 

So there, we hope you learn a thing 
or two from our venture into the world 
of economics. It was a tough enough 
trial. Feel free to send your philoso-
phical ponderings or flaming objec-
tions to our website if you share our 
urge to be heard.

Are you a financial
delinquent?
Can you bear the risk of
facing twenty years?
Are you an air miles
millionaire?
How much money can you
legally carry on you?
how do you make money?
is greed necessary?
which zombie bank has
wasted your savings?
How rich is too rich?
What’s your pin-code?
Is capitalism dead?
can I borrow a dollar?
Did you pay for that?
When was the last time
your nation went
bankrupt?
Can you tell the difference
between 10 Thai Baht and 2 
euro?
Who's going to outscam 
Bernard Madoff?
What's the color of money? 

EDITORIAL

NOT SO F.A.Q.

#4

THE EXPERTS

1 I think the United States and the 
United Kingdom are making a lot of 
mistakes right now. So it really does 
look like it’s going to be a long and 
drawn out affair. There will be pe-
riods when things improve and pe-
riods when things get worse, but for 
the most part I fear that we’re not 
getting it right. So we may have some 
long, terrible years ahead of us. If 
you compare our situation to Japan, 
that nation has been going through 
terrible times for about nineteen 
years now. The current Japanese side 
market is 75% below where it was in 
1990. The US and the UK are in much 
worse shape than Japan ever was. Ja-
pan was a very large creditor nation 
with the highest foreign currency re-
serves in the world. America and the 
United Kingdom are debtor nations 
with no foreign currency reserves 
at all, so I bet this crisis will last a 
very long time. It all depends on how 
long people high up will continue to 
make mistakes and what steps they 
decide to take. But to think that you 
can solve a problem of too much debt 
and too much consumption with even 
more debt and more consumption is 
completely ludicrous. It’ll only make 
things worse.
2 (laughs) Mankind will continue to 
encounter these crises until the end 

of time. Because the lessons that we 
learn from any crisis are easily for-
gotten by the generations that come 
after us. And even if these next ge-
nerations do remember what went 
wrong, they will probably just make 
a whole series of other mistakes. I 
wish it wasn’t that easy, but so far 
we’ve gone from one set of screw-ups 
to the next, especially with this army 
of bureaucrats pulling the strings. 
There will always be bankruptcies, 
financial failure, good times and bad 
times. People have tried to figure out 
for thousands of years how to pre-
vent the recurrence of bad times, but 
no one has ever come up with a las-
ting solution. Personally I doubt very 
much if there even is such a solution, 
considering the fact that human na-
ture is what it is. So I’m pretty sure 
we’ll keep at it.

3 I believe that there’s going to be a 
time when paper banknotes - mo-
ney as we know it - will become very 
suspect and people will try to use so-
mething else. Right now, paper money 
is being printed at a very rapid rate 
and in many parts of the world, the 
role of this sort of currency is being 
debated. I’d say that this is going to 
lead to a very high inflation. People 
will have less and less confidence in 
foreign paper money, especially the 
US dollar. In some countries, paper 
money will become very suspect. 
What normally happens then is that 
the currency collapses and govern-
ments have to reissue. They collect all 
of the old money and start again with 
new money. Now I’m not sure if this is 
actually going to happen. But in the 
next decade or two in some countries 
around the world, the weather will be 
getting so bad that people will resort 
to other things like seashells or silver 
or something else, I really couldn’t 
tell. 

4 The system would be better off if 
everyone could use any currency they 
wanted or use anything as currency 
such as gold, silver, etc. This is the 
way the world worked for thousands 
of years up until about the 1930s. I 
also think we would be better off wi-
thout central banks. A system with-
out central banks has its problems, 
but a system with central banks is 
worse because then you have bureau-
crats trying to decide what should be 
done. And you just know that they 
usually make things worse. In the 

United States for instance, we have 
a central bank that is borrowing huge 
amounts of money based on garbage. 
If we didn’t have a central bank, we 
wouldn’t be able to put the system 
even deeper in debt or print gigantic 
amounts of money. So I think that we 
would be better off without central 
banks. Yes, the other alternatives do 
have their own problems, but in my 
opinion these problems are not as 
bad as with a central bank.

5 Capitalism is the best system we 
have right now. It’s got its problems 
but compared to anything else out 
there, it’s not nearly as bad as the 
alternatives. One of the problems is 
that the governments – especially in 
the US and in the UK – won’t let ca-
pitalism work. When people get in 
financial trouble in America, the go-
vernment eventually saves them. But 
that’s not how capitalism is supposed 
to work. That’s actually just socialism 
for the rich. If the government would 
let capitalism function in the way it’s 
meant to, there wouldn’t be so many 
problems. Yes, people would have 
been failing. But instead of letting 
that happen, they’ve propped up and 
bailed out companies, assets and 
people. That’s not what capitalism is 
about. We are now in the same situa-
tion as in Japan, with zombie banks 
and zombie companies. That’s it: wel-
fare for the rich. When people fail in 
a capitalist system, they should go 
bankrupt and other people should 
start over. That is one of the funda-
mental principles of the market; when 
people fail, they fail and the market 
sorts out the rest. In the past ten to 
fifteen years, the governments have 
refused to let the market do its own 
work. That’s the real problem, not 
capitalism itself. In 1998, the major 
American company Long-Term Capi-
tal Management filed for bankruptcy. 
The central bank refused to let the 
market sort itself out and stepped in 
to save a lot of failing firms on Wall 
Street. That’s not capitalism. That’s a 
government trying to save its friends. 
If everybody had gone bankrupt, we 
wouldn’t be having a lot of the pro-
blems we have right now. That’s the 
way capitalism is supposed to work, 
but it’s definitely not what has been 
going on for the past fifteen years or 
so.

1 Contrary to what the financial media 
are telling us, I think that the worst 
of the crisis is still ahead of us. This 
isn’t an episodic crisis; it’s a clear de-
monstration of a systemic and struc-
tural flaw in the system. We’re not 
going to solve this problem unless we 
change the very nature of our moneta-
ry system. So far, nobody has shown 
any sign of doing this. Governments 
all over the world have implemented 
policies that are dealing with this cri-
sis as if it’s not a cyclical problem. 
They seem to believe that we’ll just 
get over it, but I’m afraid it’s not that 
simple. 

2 Over the last 25 years we’ve had 
97 major banking crises around the 
world. So this crisis may be the big-
gest, but it’s also just number 98, the 
next in line. We’ve had 187 monetary 
crises. So these things happen very 
frequently. Every single one of these 
crises is analyzed as if it’s the first 
and only one of its kind. Today we’re 
talking about sub prime loans and de-
rivatives. Well there weren’t any deri-
vatives and sub prime loans in Argen-
tina or Russia, right? I think that the 
system itself is unstable and we won’t 
be getting out of this slump unless 

we revisit the structure of our mone-
tary system. Allow me to use a me-
taphor. Let’s say I sell you a car that 
has a defective steering wheel and 
no brakes. If I send you on a long trip 
in that car, you will break your neck. 
I’m 100% sure of that. I don’t know in 
which curve or if you’ll be driving up- 
or downhill, but I’m sure you’ll crash. 
However, some people might still be 
saying that you’re a bad driver ins-
tead of questioning the vehicle. That’s 
where the problem is. As long as we 
don’t talk about the car, all of us are 
going to keep on crashing. The trigger 
might be different every time, but the 
results will always be the same. Ba-
sically the rest of the economy is put 
into trouble because of the instability 
of the financial system.

3 It’s going to get pretty messy for the 
next five years at least. In the long 
run however, I hope that this species 
that claims to be intelligent – we call 
ourselves sapiens for a reason – is 
able to learn something instead of 
repeat its mistakes. Because so far 
we’ve just been rebuilding the sys-
tem exactly the way it was before. The 
1907 banking crisis was solved in the 
same way: with government money. 
Monetary crises have been dealt with 
by rebuilding the system exactly how 
it was, with the same players in place. 
So I hope that somewhere during the 
next five years, we will somehow get 
the point. Maybe the euro or the dol-
lar will fall. But the real issue for this 
century or for the next twenty years 
isn’t just a monetary and financial 
one. We’re having climate changes, 
energy issues, we’re living in an aging 
society and there’s a shift in the eco-
nomy from an industrial age to an 
age of information. So we will have to 
invent a whole new society and eco-
nomy. The deals that were made in 
the 19th century aren’t going to solve 
the problems we have in the 21st. So 
I believe that the sooner we do this, 
the better off we’ll be in the end. I’m 
actually working on solutions in that 
direction, that’s also why I came back 
to Europe.

In Star Trek, Dr. Spock once made the 
claim that in 2400, society wouldn’t 
be using money anymore. All the 
people would instead be doing what 
they are passionate about in order to 
develop themselves and their com-
munity. They’re all pretty good at 
what they do and everything ends up 

falling into place. I do somehow be-
lieve that something like that could 
be true, but… only in 2400. I’m actual-
ly interested in what we manage to 
achieve between now and then. On a 
humanitarian level, I believe we have 
the choice between a breakdown and 
a breakthrough in the next five or ten 
years. We need to solve big issues and 
we don’t have ten more years to do it. 
The real problem is the monopoly of 
our currency. We’re trying to deal with 
all of our social, environmental, eco-
nomical and educational issues with 
the same tool, which is conventional 
money. That just doesn’t make sense. 
Once we start getting to that point, 
and I believe and hope that we’ll end 
up doing that, the future looks bright.

4 I think it’s the solution. A comple-
mentary currency is a unit of account 
other than conventional money, 
used to make exchanges. Everybody 
has already been using it. When you 
go to a supermarket, you receive 
points. When you take a plane, you 
have miles. And it works; we can 
do it on any scale. We don’t have to 
think small. The question is how can 
we use this concept to do something 
more intelligent and important than 
having people return to a supermar-
ket, which doesn’t have any social or 
economical benefit except for the su-
permarket. Around the world, about 
5,000 non-commercial experiments 
with complementary currencies are 
going on, ranging from elderly care to 
environmental projects. That’s what I 
think we should do and can do. In any 
case our planet will be fine; the real 
question is how many of us will sur-
vive our own stupidity if we insist on 
doing things the same way.

5 One of the common denominators 
between capitalism and communism 
was actually the belief that you need 
to do everything with a single natio-
nal currency. I call that a blind spot. 
The only difference is that the govern-
ment owns the bank in a communist 
system whereas in a capitalist system 
the private sector owns the banks. 
Capitalism isn’t the problem; it’s the 
hypothesis that a monetary mono-
poly is a necessity because it’s some-
how more efficient, because it isn’t. I 
don’t think that it’s an issue of capita-
lism or non-capitalism. It’s a structu-
ral, systemic issue, which is recurrent 
in every economy in the world.

change in your pocket while you’re at 
it? Like that outweighs the constant 
underlying budgettary stress that is 
always lurking under the surface of 
your thoughts with every step you 
take. 

It’s great that these experiments are 
being conducted and all, but if those 
are the kind of conclusions that these 
scientists are coming to, then I dread 
to see how they will be translated into 
management policies (because face 
it, that’s where this sort of ‘knowle-
dge’ is applied into practice). Call me 
a sceptic, but for some reason I just 
don’t believe in gaining my spiritual 
strength from worshipping a pile of 
money bills. Now we’re not being 
naive and saying that every problem 
in the world is a sole and direct result 
of the existence of money, but we do 
believe that money can be the wrong 
sort of motivational agent for some 
sort of people. Does that justify a call 
for its abolition? No, but it does pro-
voke a thought or two about how it’s 
used and distributed throughout our 
society. 

CRAVING FOR A MONEY 
SHOT
Yes, money would be a great thing if 
everybody had plenty of it and the 
world was a safe place where you 
could walk around all day leisurely 
counting your abundant bankroll. Un-
fortunately, that’s not the way things 
work in real life where money is more 
of a worry than a blessing for most. 
But to start using the money you do 
have as a pocket-sized totem pole 
seems a bit far-fetched to us. At the 
risk of sounding like sandal-sporting 
flower children, maybe we’ve come 
to a point in evolution where human 
beings are enlightened enough to 
overcome their primal reflexes and no 
longer need to accumulate amounts 
of wealth beyond what they can rea-
sonably hope to consume in order to 
feel good about themselves. Maybe 
we can reward public figures like 
top athletes with things like unlimi-
ted social credit instead of preposte-
rous paychecks that can feed small 
countries. Or hell, maybe we are just 
being naive and money is just one of 
those things a person can never get 
enough of once they’ve had a single 
taste. 

The way a crackhead can’t have too 
much crack. You get addicted to it 
when you’re still young, slowly tur-
ned into a slave-like junkie through a 
lifetime of tasters, freebies and cut-
rate testhits. You get hooked on capi-
tal early on and unsuspectingly, with 
a little pocket money that buys you 
the freedom to purchase the candy of 
your own preference. And every bir-
thday you get a little more, but never 
enough to get you really, really high 
(like when you’re counting stacks of 
twenties and fifties in a social expe-
riment, for example). A weekend job 
jacks things up and gets you your 
first scooter or  designer handbag. 
You start getting your buzz carefully 
metered out according to the budget, 
no highly concentrated intravenous 
injections but a nagging IV therapy 
that always keeps you fiending for a 
real hit. Working your day job to get 
your fix at the end of month. A fix you 
know you’ll have to measure meticu-
lously if you want it to last until your 
next score. Bills following each other 
up like monthly withdrawal signs, the 
little ‘me-money’ you do get to spend 
a watered-down mirage of what 
you’re trained to dream of. State lot-
tery dangled in front of your nose like 
a magic mountain of top-shelf stash, 
the one ever-lasting fix you’ll never 
have to dose in fear of running out. 

We’re not entirely sure what the 
point of this story is because we 
don’t want to qualify ourselves 
as the people who should decide 
whether or not the information in it is 
good or bad, but we sure did feel that 
it was worth giving some thought. If 
you disagree and want your money 
back, sorry but this is a free maga-
zine which according to us justifies 
our lack of a conclusive point. Feel 
free to engage us in a public debate 
of wits & intellect on our website, 
which is www.postrmagazine.com. 

the Euro the feds seized no more than 
ten forged 50Bef coins. 

In spite of its current complex design, 
the US dollar is still the most popu-
lar currency amongst counterfeiters. 
Partly because the government is 
unable to get all the old notes out of 
circulation, which means that you 
can print a dollar the way it was of-
ficially printed in 1950, roll it in the 
dirt a few times and innocently try 
to pay with it. Financial delinquents 
all over the world have already gi-
ven it a shot. Even artists have tried 
this. There’s the art of James Stephen 
George Boggs for example, who’s 
known for his hand-drawn, one-sided 
depictions of a dollar that he spends 
in stores and restaurants. ‘Compared 
to the US dollar, counterfeit euros are 
still a manageable phenomenon’, is 
the response of the CDBV-M bureau, 
a crime unit of ten federal detectives 
exclusively charged with Belgian 
counterfeiting matters. However, as 
fast as the reign of the dollar seems 
to be collapsing nowadays, that’s 
how gradually the interest in the 
European currency has grown ever 
since its introduction in 2002. Darn, 
just when we were starting to believe 
that the European Central Bank had 
successfully combined all of its awe-
inspiring know-how and highly ad-
vanced technology to create the most 
sophisticated banknote ever. 

‘It is true that money counterfeiters 
become ever more innovative’, CDBV-
M chief commissioner Jeroen Peeters 
confirms while dropping a large pile 
of fake banknotes onto his desk in 
the National Bank of Belgium. Last 
year, the Belgian feds categorized 

The Wardenclyffe Tower was one of Nikola Tesla's projects, designed to demonstrate the power of wireless energy transmission. The project was financially backed by J.P. Morgan (whose name still lives on 
through JPMorgan Chase & Co) and could have been a giant step towards an endless supply of free and clean energy. Morgan pulled the plug on the project in 1904 when he decided it would never be a profitable 
tool and even told other investors to keep their money away. Morgan would later on become a hero of economics after single-handedly solving the 1907 banking crisis. The tower was destroyed after the project 
was dismantled along with its dream of free energy, all that remains are the disintegrating ruins of the administration building on Tesla Street in New York. A perfect example of how money and profit changed 
the course of history.

John Pierpont "Jack" Morgan Jr. - New York City - 1913
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“That’s not 
capitalism. That’s a 
government trying 
to save its friends.”

Human Behaviour Under The Sweet Spell 
Of Wealth

Sometimes, it’s painfully funny to 
see history repeat itself. About two 
years ago, frightened customers of 
US bank IndyMac and UK bank Nor-
thern Rock frantically started with-
drawing the money in their accounts 
before the banks would become in-
solvent and thereby unable to give 
them back their life savings in one 
piece. The two financial fortresses 
had been hit hard by the financial 
crisis and as their clients saw the 
clouds gather over their crumbling 
castle walls, they came to collect. 
Of course, that only made matters 
worse, as the banks now started lo-
sing even more money, which made 
even more people stand in line out-
side the bank’s overworked offices, 
hoping to get their pennies out sa-
fely from under the teetering giants’ 
crumbling corpses; which of course 
only made things worse, but try tel-
ling that to somebody who’s about to 
lose their every penny thanks to the 
bank that supposed to safeguard it 
for them. 

This bank run (apparently this sort of 
thing happens often enough for us to 
have a special word for it) led to the 
banks’ eventual collapse into ban-
kruptcy, burying many a pension and 
trust fund under their rubble-reduced 
ruins in the process. How is that pain-
fully funny and not just merely pain-
ful, you ask? Because the exact same 
thing happened exactly 100 years be-
fore, during the financial crisis that 
was taking place then! Called the 
Panic of 1907, look it up if you don’t 
believe us. Well, it sure looks like we 
learned our lesson that time around, 
wouldn’t you say? Or during the Great 
Depression for that matter, another 
crisis that took place in the 1930’s and 
pretty much caused the entire world 
to go bankrupt and justified entire 
populations into becoming a bunch of 
fascists. 

Anyway, this Panic of 1907 occurred 
because a greedy banker called F. Au-
gustus Heinze and his brother Otto 
came up with a plan to corner the 
market on stock of the United Cop-
per Company by buying up a boatload 
of shares from short sellers, making 
its price soar high on the stock mar-
ket. In case you don’t know what that 
means: they were trying to make an 
easy buck. It was a con, a scam, a 
heist, whatever you want to call it. 
The plan was to make the United Cop-
per stock increase in value artificially 
by aggressively buying up stock from 
short-sellers, who would be forced to 
sell to the brothers at full price. Long 
story short: the Heinze bros made 
a tiny miscalculation and only suc-
ceeded in pulling the plush Persian 
rug from under their own obese feet. 
When the market got wind of the foul 
stench of their failed plan, and as the 
failing of United Copper spread to the 
banks that Heinze was associated 
to, families and companies came for 
their hard-earned dollars. This bank 
run soon infected the rest of the eco-
nomy and within a few days, the en-
tire stock market was on the verge 
of disintegrating into a big cloud of 
zero’s. 

“What you need 
to remember is 
that this entire 
crisis was caused 
by greed.”
NOTHING COMES FOR 
FREE
The most important thing to remem-
ber about this story is this: the shit 
hit the financial fan because some 
obscenely rich, yet still unsatisfied 
corporate sleazebag who was mainly 
known for buying off judges to settle 
legal business disputes, tried to make 
even more money by pulling the big-
gest heist of his life. What you need to 
remember is that this entire crisis was 
caused by greed. Two brothers made 
a wrong bet, and an entire nation had 
to pay to bail them out. The point that 
we’re so emphatically trying to make, 
is that it’s always actual people who 
are responsible for things of this ma-
gnitude going wrong, not abstract 
concepts like housing bubbles that 
are made up by those who fucked up, 
concepts that only serve to dilute the 
responsibility into something vague 
and uncontrollable that you can’t pin 
on anyone. Well guess what, things 
don’t run themselves, people do.  

“If you have to ask the price, you can't 
afford it." J.P. Morgan – Cigar-chewing 
Money Mogul

So it’s clear that greed caused this 
crisis, but in a way, greed would also 
be the thing that resolved it. The core 

Print the Money
and run
A descent into the world of
counterfeit money

* There's 

something not quite 

right about making an entire 

magazine about money and then 

just giving it away for free. But being 

such nice guys, we just couldn't bring 

ourselves to charge our loyal (freeloading) 

readers any cash. So, how do you make people 

pay for a free magazine? By giving 

everybody a none-dollar bill of course! So on 

top of our highly valued opinions and wide 

array of little known facts, we'll even give you 

the only piece of currency that can buy that 

which is already free. Just so we can feel 

aprreciated and you can feel like you've 

actually bought something for the 

sake of its intellectual content.

Spend it wisely.

what’S
the color
of
money?


